
 
Eleventh Parliament                     Third Session 

           
(No. 024)                                  (136) 

 
 

REPUBLIC OF KENYA 
 

ELEVENTH PARLIAMENT – (THIRD SESSION) 
 

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
 

ORDERS OF THE DAY 
 

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015 AT 2.30 P.M 
 

ORDER OF BUSINESS 
PRAYERS 
1. Administration of Oath 
2. Communication from the Chair 
3. Messages 
4. Petitions 
5. Papers 
6. Notices of Motion  
7. Statements 

 
8*.  PROCEDURAL MOTION –   REDUCTION OF PUBLICATION PERIOD FOR  
        BILLS 
       (The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 
 THAT, notwithstanding the provisions of Standing Order 120, this House resolves to 
reduce the publication period of the following Bills:- 
 

(i) The Division of Revenue Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 11 of 2015) from 7 
to 2 days. 
 

(ii) The Fair Administrative Action Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 10 of 2015) 
from 14 to 7 days. 

 
9*. THE DIVISION OF REVENUE  BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 11 OF 
 2015) 

(The Chairperson, Budget and Appropriations Committee) 
 
    First Reading  

 
10**. THE FAIR  ADMINISTRATIVE ACTION  BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL  
  NO. 10 OF 2015) 

(The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 
    First Reading  
 

      ….….……/11*. 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (137) 
 
 
11*. MOTION – REPORT ON VETTING OF NOMINEE FOR APPOINTMENT AS 
 AMBASSADOR TO THE FEDERAL REPUBLIC OF SOMALIA 
           (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Defence & Foreign Relations)  
 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee on Defence 
and Foreign Relations on the vetting of the nominee for appointment as Ambassador, laid on 
the Table of the House on Tuesday, 17 March, 2015, and pursuant to Article 132(2)(e) of the 
Constitution, approves the appointment of Major General (Rtd) Lucas K. Tumbo as 
Ambassador to the Federal Republic of Somalia. 

 
(Mover to reply) 

         (Balance of time 26 mins)       
 

12*.  COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

(i) The Protection Against Domestic Violence Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 28 of 
2013) 

     (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs) 
 

(Resumption of consideration interrupted on Tuesday, March 17, 2015) 
(To commence from Clause 15) 

 
(ii) The Public Audit Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 38 of 2014) 

      (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance, Planning and Trade)  
                 
13*. MOTION - THE SPECIAL REPORT OF THE PUBLIC INVESTMENTS   

   COMMITTEE  
   (The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee) 
 

       THAT, this House adopts the Special Report of the Public Investments Committee on 
the Recapitalization and Balance Sheet Restructuring of Telkom Kenya Limited, laid on the 
Table of the House on Tuesday, April 29, 2014.       
     

14*. MOTION -  REPORT ON THE PRIVATIZATION OF THE PUBLIC    
   SECTOR OWNED/CONTROLLED SUGAR COMPANIES 
    (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance, Planning & Trade) 
    

 THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee on Finance, 
Planning and Trade on the Privatization of the Public Sector Owned/Controlled Sugar 
Companies (Nzoia Sugar Company, South Nyanza Sugar Company, Chemilil Sugar Company, 
Muhoroni Sugar Company and Miwani Sugar Company), laid on the Table of the House on 
Tuesday, December 2, 2014. 
     

 (Resumption of debate adjourned on Tuesday, March 3, 2015)      
 

       ….….……/15*. 
 
 



 
(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (138) 

 
       

15*. MOTION -  REPORT OF THE FIFTH ORDINARY SESSION OF THE PAN- 
   AFRICAN PARLIAMENT & THE ANNUAL SPEAKERS’    
   CONFERENCE (2014) 

   (The Second Chairperson of Committees) 
 

 THAT, this House adopts the  Report of the Fifth Ordinary Session of the Pan-
African Parliament and the Annual Speakers’ Conference (2014), together with the Revised 
Protocol to the Constitutive Act Relating to the Pan-African Parliament, laid on the Table of 
the House on Thursday, February 12, 2015. 

 
 

* Denotes Orders of the Day 
** Denotes Bills that ought to be passed by Parliament by 

 May 26, 2015, in accordance with Article 261 of the Constitution 
 

         
 

 
           
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
            ….….……Notices 

 



 
(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (139) 

 
 

N O T I C E S  
 
 

I.   THE PROTECTION AGAINST DOMESTIC VIOLENCE 
  BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 28 OF 2013) 

 
1. Notice is given that the Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice and 

Legal Affairs, intends to move the following amendments to the Protection Against 
Domestic Violence Bill, 2013 at the Committee Stage— 

 
CLAUSE 4 
THAT, clause 4 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting paragraphs (b), (d), (e),(f),(g)and (h);  
(b) by deleting subclause (3); 
(c) by deleting subclause (4); 

 
CLAUSE 5 
THAT, clause 5 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1)— 
(i) by deleting the words “estranged spouse or former spouse” appearing in 

paragraph (a); 
(ii) by deleting the words “in the opinion of the court and” appearing immediately 

after the words “person who” in paragraph (f); 
(b) by deleting subclause (5); 

 
CLAUSE 7 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 7; 
 
CLAUSE 8 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 8; 
 
CLAUSE 9 
THAT, clause 9 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1) and replacing with a new subclause (1) as follows— 
“(1) Any person who reasonably suspects that an offence of domestic violence is being 
or has been committed may give such information to the police officers or any other 
person in authority”; 

 
 



(No.024)        THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (140) 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “by virtue of such reporting attacks, intimidates 
or does any harmful act to the person providing information” appearing immediately 
after the words “person who” and substituting therefor the words “attacks, intimidates 
or harms a person who reports domestic violence”; 

(c) by deleting subclause (3); 
(d) by deleting subclause (4); 
(e) by deleting subclause (7);  

 

CLAUSE 10 
THAT, clause 10 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1) and replacing with a new subclause (1) as follows— 
“(1) A person who is in a domestic relationship with another person may apply to 
Court for a protection order in respect of that other person.”; 

(b) in subclause (2), by deleting the word “shall” appearing immediately after the word 
“application” and substituting therefor the word “may”; 

(c) in subclause (3) by deleting the word “shall” appearing immediately after the word 
“application” and substituting therefor the word “may”; 

 

CLAUSE 11 
THAT, clause 11 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2)— 

(a) by inserting the words “a parent, guardian, probation officer, police officer, person 
acting on behalf of a non-governmental organization concerned with the welfare of 
victims of domestic violence or, with leave of court, any other person.” immediately 
after the word “through”; 

(b) by deleting paragraphs (a), (b), (c), (d), (e), (f), (g) (h), (i) and (j); 
 

CLAUSE 12 
THAT, clause 12 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2) by deleting paragraph (b); 
 
CLAUSE 14 
THAT, clause 14 of the Bill be amended in subclause (4) by deleting the words “and, if the 
respondent fails to appear, the court shall, subject to section 23 (3), issue a warrant for the 
arrest of the respondent” appearing immediately after the words “to the order”; 
 

CLAUSE 15 
THAT, clause 15 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2) by deleting the word “encourages” 
appearing immediately after the words “respondent who” and substituting therefor the words 
“aids or abets”; 
 
CLAUSE 16 
THAT, clause 16 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the words “including 
those provided by religious institutions and any suitable cultural programmes subject to their 
satisfaction that these programmes will not in any way undermine the objects of this Act or 
the values and principles of the Constitution” and substituting therefor the words “or any 
other programme that is acceptable to the court”; 

 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (141) 
 

CLAUSE 18 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 18; 
 
CLAUSE 19 
THAT, clause 19 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “is inciting or encouraging, or has incited or 
encouraged, the respondent to engage in behaviour against a protected person where 
that behaviour, if engaged in by respondent, would amount to domestic violence” and 
substituting therefor the words “aids and abets the respondent”; 

(b) by deleting subclause (2); 
(c) by deleting subclause (3); 

 
CLAUSE 20 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 20; 
 
CLAUSE 21 
THAT, clause 21 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (2) by deleting the word “follow” appearing in paragraph (b) and 
substituting therefor the word “stalk”; 

(b) in subclause (7) by deleting the word “modified” appearing immediately after the 
words “revoked or” in paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the word “varied”; 

(c) by deleting subclause (8); 
(d) by deleting subclause (9); 

 
CLAUSE 22  
THAT, clause 22 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (5); 
 
CLAUSE 23  
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 23; 
 
CLAUSE 25 
THAT, clause 25 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “has received an explanation of the order in 
accordance with section 31” appearing immediately after the words “protection order”; 

(b) by deleting subclause (2); 
 
 
 
 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (142) 
 
CLAUSE 27 
THAT, clause 27 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “of the first class” appearing immediately after 
the word “Courts”; 

 
(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “soon as possible” appearing immediately after 

the words “court as” in paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the words “may be 
directed by the court”; 

(c) by deleting subclauses (4), (5), (6), (7), (8), (9),(10),(11),(12) and (13); 
 
CLAUSE 28  
THAT, clause 28 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclauses (2), (3) and (4); 

 
CLAUSE 29 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 29;  
 
CLAUSE 32 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 32; 
 
CLAUSE 33 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 33; 
 
CLAUSE 34 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 34; 
 
CLAUSE 35 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 35; 
 
CLAUSE 36 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 36; 
 
CLAUSE 37 
THAT, clause 37 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclauses (4), (5), (6) and (7); 
 
CLAUSE 38 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 38; 
 
CLAUSE 39 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 39; 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (143) 
 
CLAUSE 40 
THAT, clause 40 of the Bill be amended by inserting a new subclause immediately after 
subclause (3)— 
“(4) A publication under this section shall be made thirty days after the final determination of 
the proceedings”; 
 
CLAUSE 42 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 42; 
 

CLAUSE 43 
THAT, clause 43 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1); 
(b) in subclause (2) by inserting the word “have” immediately after the words “shall”; 

 
CLAUSE 44 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 44; 
 
CLAUSE 45 
THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 45. 

 
2. Notice is given that the Member for Matungulu Constituency (Hon. Mutinda 

Mule), intends to move the following amendments to the Protection Against 
Domestic Violence Bill, 2013 at the Committee Stage— 

 
CLAUSE 8 
THAT, clause 8 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by— 
(i) deleting the words “, in consultation with county executives,” appearing 

immediately after the word “shall”; 
(ii) deleting the words “by county executives” appearing immediately after the word 

“establishment”; 
(b) in subclause (4) by deleting the words “the County Executives shall work with” 

appearing immediately after the  expression “subsection (1),” and substituting therefor 
the words “the Cabinet Secretary shall prescribe”. 

 
3. Notice is given that the Member for Makadara (Hon. Benson Mutura) intends to 

move the following amendments to the Protection Against Domestic Violence Bill, 
2013 at the Committee Stage— 

 
CLAUSE 6 
THAT, clause 6 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (3).  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (144) 
 

II. THE PUBLIC AUDIT BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
BILL NO. 38 OF 2014) 

    
1. Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on Finance, 

Planning and Trade, intends to move the following amendments to the Public 
Audit Bill, 2014 at the Committee Stage— 

 
CLAUSE 4 
 
 THAT, clause 4 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) in subclause (1) (c) by deleting the word “things” and substituting therefor the word 
“duties; 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the expression “subject to Article 234(5) of the 
Constitution”; 

 
(c) in subclause (3) by deleting the words “ as far as it is appropriate to do so” appearing 

immediately after the words “ the Republic”. 
 

CLAUSE 5 
THAT, clause 5 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting paragraph (e) and 
substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 
 

“(e) is a practising member of good standing of a professional body of accountants 
recognized by law.” 
 

CLAUSE 7 
THAT, clause 7 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) (a) by deleting the words “financial 
systems of state organs” appearing immediately after the words “and overall” and substituting 
therefor the words “governance at national and county governments”. 
 
CLAUSE 8 
THAT, clause 8 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting the words “subject to section 11 of this Act”; 
 

(b) in paragraph (c) by deleting the expression “subject to Article 234(5) of the 
constitution”; 

 

(c) in paragraph (d) by deleting the expression “subject to Article 234(5) of the 
Constitution”; 
 

(d) in paragraph (j) by deleting the words “ and in consultation with the public Service 
Commission and the National Treasury,” appearing immediately after the words 
“relevant laws,”; 

 

(e) by inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (k)— 
 

“(ka) provide information that may be needed in investigation accordance with the 
provisions of this Act.” 

 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (145) 
 
CLAUSE 11 
 
THAT, clause 11 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) by deleting subclause (5) and substituting therefor the following new  subclause—  
 

“(5) The President shall, within fourteen days of the expiry of the period 
prescribed under subsection (2), constitute a selection panel comprising one 
representative from— 
 

(a) the Office of the President; 
 

(b) the Ministry for the time being responsible for matters relating to 
finance; 

 

(c) the office of the Attorney-General; 
 

(d) the Ministry for the time being responsible for matters relating to 
the public service; 

 

(e) the Institute of Certified Public Accountants of Kenya; and 
 

(f) the Association of Professional Societies of East Africa, 
 

for the purpose of considering the applicants and selecting at least three 
persons qualified for appointment as Auditor- General: 
 

Provided that for the purposes of selection and shortlisting of the said three 
persons, the selection panel shall hold its proceedings in public and submit to 
Parliament a report of the interview proceedings, which should include inter 
alia, scores of each candidate interviewed by individual members of the 
interviewing panel together with the criteria used in selecting the names 
forwarded”; 

 

(b) in subclause (6) by deleting the words “public Service Commission” and substituting 
therefor the words “selection panel”; 

 

(c) in subclause (9) (b) by deleting the words “Public Service Commission” and 
substituting therefor the words “selection panel”; 

 
(d) in subclause (12) by deleting the words “ selection committee convened under 

subsection (4).” and substituting therefor the words “ selection panel convened under 
subsection (5).” 

 
CLAUSE 14 
 
 THAT, clause 14 of the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new clause— 
 

Development and 
approval of organizational 
structure. 

14. The office of the Auditor-General shall develop an 
organizational structure for consideration and approval by 
the Audit Advisory Board. 
 

 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (146) 
 
CLAUSE 15 
THAT, clause 15 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a)  in subclause (1), by deleting the words “Public Service Commission” and 
substituting therefor the “Advisory Board”; 
 

(b) In  subclause (2), by deleting paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the following 
new paragraph— 

 

“(b) holds the same minimum qualifications as required for the appointment of 
Auditor General as specified in section 5 of this Act”. 

 

CLAUSE 16 
THAT, clause 16 (1) of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “deputize the Auditor 
General and” immediately after the words “Auditor-General shall”. 
 
CLAUSE 17 
THAT, clause 17 of the Bill be amended— 
 
(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “and the Auditor-General may appoint such staff 

subject to Article 234 (5) of the Constitution” appearing immediately after the words 
“Salaries and Remuneration Commission” and substituting therefor “ and subject to 
Article 230 of the Constitution”; 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “ under this Act and approved by the Public 
Service Commission.” appearing immediately after the words “the Auditor-General”. 

 
CLAUSE 21 
THAT, clause 21 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word “may” 
appearing immediately after the words “the Auditor-General” and substituting therefor 
“shall”. 
 
CLAUSE 22 
THAT, clause 22 of the Bill be amended in subclause (3) by deleting the words “What will 
happen if this is abused?” appearing immediately after the words “information so obtained”.  
 

CLAUSE 25 
THAT, clause 25 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) in subclause (1) by — 
 

(i)   inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (g)— 
 

“(ga) the Senior Deputy Auditor General who shall be the secretary to 
the Board and an ex-officio member”; 
 

(ii) deleting paragraphs (e) and (g); 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the expression “subsection (2)(c) to (g)” and substituting 
therefor the expression “subsection (1)(c) to (g)”; 
 

(c) by deleting subclause (3) and substituting  therefor the following new subclause— 
 

“(3) The members under subsection (1) shall appoint a chairperson from amongst 
themselves." 

 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (147) 
 
CLAUSE 27 
 

THAT, clause 27 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word “generally” 
appearing immediately before the words “to advice”. 
 

CLAUSE 30 
 

 THAT, clause 30 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “or information” 
immediately after the word “documents”. 
 

CLAUSE 31 
 

THAT, clause 31 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new subclause 
immediately after subclause (6)— 
 

“(6A) Where an audit report has been tabled, the Speaker of the National Assembly 
shall invite the Auditor General to present the report before the committee of the 
whole House. 

 
NEW CLAUSE 
 

THAT, the following new clause be inserted immediately after clause 31— 

 
CLAUSE 35 
 
 THAT, clause 35 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 
 

(b) inserting a new  subclause immediately the renumbered subclause (1)— 
 

“ (2) The Auditor-General may undertake a comprehensive performance audit 
within six months after the completion of any national or county project to 
evaluate whether the citizen has got value for money in the project and submit 
that report to Parliament or county assembly for tabling and debate.” 

CLAUSE 36 
 
THAT, clause 36 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “by Parliament” immediately 
after the words “upon request. 
 

CLAUSE 37 
 

THAT, clause 37 of the Bill be deleted. 
 

CLAUSE 38 
 

THAT, Clause 38 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “may” appearing immediately 
after the words “The Auditor-General” and substituting therefor “shall”. 
 
 

Audit reports to be 
submitted to 
Parliament and the 
relevant county 
assembly. 

31A. (1)   All reports of an audit shall be submitted to 
Parliament or the relevant county assembly and made 
available to any person who applies for information or part 
thereof, except in cases where access to such information is 
restricted by law. 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (148) 
 
CLAUSE 39 
 THAT, clause 39 of the Bill be deleted. 
 

CLAUSE 40 
 THAT, clause 40 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) by renumbering subclause (1)  as subclause (1A); 
 

(b) by inserting the following new subclause immediately before the renumbered 
subclause (1A)— 

 

“(1) The Auditor General shall audit national security organs and confidential 
expenditure in the process of carrying out his or her mandate under the 
Constitution, this Act and any other written law”; 

 

(c) in the renumbered subclause (1A)(b), by— 
 

(i) inserting the words “ in consultation with the National Security Council,” 
immediately before the words “has issued a certificate”; 

(ii) deleting the words “Attorney General” appearing immediately after the words 
“opinion of the” and substituting therefore the words “ National Security 
Council”; 

 

(d) in subclause (2) by— 
 

(i) deleting the words “or relations between the two levels of government” 
appearing in paragraph (c); 

(ii) deleting paragraph (d); 
 

(iii) inserting the word “foreign” immediately before the word “persons” appearing 
in paragraph (e); 

 

(e) in subclause (3), by deleting the words “special or joint committee of Parliament and 
the President” appearing immediately after the words “disclose to a” and substituting 
therefor the words “ a relevant committee of Parliament and the National Security 
Council”; 
 

(f) in subclause (5) by— 
 

(i) deleting the words “carrying out”  appearing immediately after the word 
“Auditor-General” and substituting therefor the words “ and staff of the 
relevant security organ involved in”; 

(ii) deleting the words “and such officers shall be at a grade equivalent to deputy 
Director of Audit or above.” appearing immediately after the words “oath of 
confidentiality”; 

 

(g)  in subclause (6), by deleting the word “Cabinet” appearing immediately after the 
words “purposes of this section” and substituting therefor the words “National 
Security Council”; 
 

(h) in subclause (7) by— 
(i) deleting the word “ Cabinet” appearing immediately after the words “decision 

of the” and substituting therefor the words “ National Security Council”; 
(ii) inserting the words “in charge” immediately after the words “the Cabinet 

Secretary”. 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (149) 
 
CLAUSE 48 
THAT, clause 48 be amended in subclause (4) by deleting subclause the phrase “thirty (30)” 
and substituting therefor the word “sixty”. 
 
CLAUSE 54 
THAT, clause 54 of the bill be deleted and replaced with the following new clause— 
 

Observing code of 
conduct. 

54. The Auditor-General in discharging his or her functions and 
responsibilities shall determine the code of conduct and ethics for all 
the Public Officers of the Office of the Auditor General which shall 
be in line with those prescribed by the Constitution, this Act, the 
Public Officer Ethics Act, 2003 and the relevant professional bodies. 

 
CLAUSE 57 
THAT, clause 57 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by inserting the words “without 
prejudice” immediately after the words “bound to disclose”. 
 
CLAUSE 60 
THAT, clause 60 of the Bill be amended— 
 

(a) in subclause (1) by— 
 

(i)  inserting the words “contrary to the Official Secrets Act or any other relevant 
law” immediately after the words “national security organs” appearing in 
paragraph (e); 
 

(ii) deleting paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 
 

“(f) knowingly and willfully discloses, publishes or publicizes the 
Auditor-General’s report or its contents to third parties including the 
media before the report is finalized and formally submitted to 
Parliament or county assembly and copied to the audited entity and 
other authorized offices; or”; 

(iii)  deleting paragraph (g); 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by— 
 

(i) deleting the words “ten million shillings” and substituting therefor the words 
“five million shillings”; 

(j) deleting the words “five years” and substituting therefor the words “three 
years”. 

CLAUSE 61 
THAT, clause 61 of the Bill be amended — 
 

(a) in subclause (1) by inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (b)— 
  

“(ba) without justification, fail to provide information within reasonable time 
that is required under this Act”; 

(b) in subclause (2) by— 
 

(i) deleting the words “two million shillings” and substituting therefor the 
words “five million shillings”; 
 

(ii) deleting the words “one year” and substituting therefor the words “three 
years”. 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (150) 
 

CLAUSE 65 
 

THAT, clause 65 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “ten” appearing immediately 
after the words “a period of” and substituting therefor “five”. 
 

CLAUSE 68 
 

THAT, clause 68 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) deleting the words “ The Cabinet Secretary responsible for finance, in consultation 
with the Auditor-General” and substituting therefor the words “The Auditor-General, 
in consultation with the Cabinet Secretary responsible for finance”; 
 

(b) by renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 
 

(c) by inserting a new subclause immediately after  the renumbered subclause (1)— 
 

“(2) The power to make regulations shall be exercised only after a draft of the 
proposed regulations has been approved by the National Assembly.” 

 
CLAUSE 72 
 
THAT, clause 72 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) inserting the words “the national or county” immediately after the words “policy 
objective of”; 
 

(b) deleting the words “or any other state organ or public entity” appearing immediately 
after the word “government”. 

 
CLAUSE 74 
 
 THAT, clause 74 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2) by deleting paragraph (f) and 
substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 
 

“(f) a contract subsisting between the Kenya National Audit Office and any 
other person before the commencement of this Act shall continue to exist as a 
contract entered into between the office of the Auditor-General and that other 
person”. 

 
2. Notice is given that the Member for Rarieda (Hon. Eng. Nicolas Gumbo) intends to 

move the following amendments to the Public Audit Bill, 2014 at the Committee 
Stage— 
 
CLAUSE 2 
 
THAT, clause 2 of the Bill be amended in the definition of “effectiveness” by inserting the 
word “cost effective” immediately after the word “means”. 
 

 
 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (151) 
 
CLAUSE 4 
 

THAT, clause 4 of the Bill be amended — 
(a)  in subclause (2) by deleting the phrase “subject to Article 234(5) of the Constitution” and 

substituting therefor the words “to be recruited through an open, transparent and 
competitive process which promotes fair competition and merit and observes all the 
values and principles of public service as contemplated in Article 232 of the 
Constitution.”  
 

(b) in subclause (3) by inserting the words “and shall have a presence in all counties” 
immediately after the words “appropriate to do so”  

 

CLAUSE 5 
 

THAT, clause 5(1) of the Bill be amended— 
(a) in paragraph (a), by inserting the words “ and of sound mind” immediately after the 

word “Kenya”; 
 

(b) in paragraph (c), by inserting the words “ and demonstrates  a verifiable and logical 
progression in the attainment of his or her educational qualifications” immediately 
after the word “Kenya”. 

CLAUSE 7 
 

THAT, clause 7(1) (a) of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) inserting the words “ and governance” immediately after the word “ financial”; 
(b) deleting the words “and public entities” and substituting therefor the words “national and 
county governments, and all public entities, in order to achieve the objects set out in Article 
249(1) of the Constitution.” 
 

CLAUSE 11 
 
THAT, clause 11 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 
 

“(2) Where a vacancy occurs under subsection (1), the President shall within 
fourteen days, by notice in the Gazette, nominate a person to be appointed as 
Auditor-General and forward the name for approval by the National Assembly 
in accordance with Article 229(1) of the Constitution”; 

 

(b) by deleting subclause (3); 
 

(c) by deleting subclause (4); 
 

(d) by deleting subclause (5); 
 

(e) by deleting subclause (6); 
 

(f) by deleting subclause (7); 
 

(g) by deleting subclause (8) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 
 
 
 
 



 

(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (152) 
 
 

“(8) The National Assembly shall, within seven days of receiving the 
nominations, consider and approve or reject the nominations”; 

 

(h) in subclause (9)  (b) by deleting the words “ from amongst the candidates forwarded by 
the Public Service Commission under subsection (6)” and substitute therefor “ within 
fourteen days of receipt of the same”; 
 

(i) in subclause (10) by — 
 

(i) deleting the words “all or” appearing immediately after the words “Assembly 
rejects”; 

 

(ii) deleting the expression “subsections (1) to (7) shall, with necessary 
modifications, apply ” and substituting therefor the expression  “ 
subsections (2) to (3) shall apply”; 

(j) by deleting subclause (12); 

CLAUSE 12 
 

THAT, clause 12 of the Bill be amended —  
(a) in subclause (1)— 

 

(i) by inserting the words “ for a period of six months” immediately after the 
words “ his or her office” in paragraph (d); 

 

(ii) by deleting the words “twelve months” and substituting therefor the words “ eight 
months”; 
 

(b) in subclause (2), by deleting the words “three months” and substituting therefor the 
words “two months”. 

CLAUSE 14 
 
THAT, clause 14 of the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new clause— 
 

Development 
and approval 
of 
organizational 
structure. 

14. The office of the Auditor-General shall develop the 
organizational structure for consideration and approval by the 
Audit Advisory Board’ 

 
CLAUSE 15 
THAT, clause 15 of the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new clause— 
 

Recruitment of 
the Senior Deputy 
Auditor General 

15. (1) There shall be a Senior Deputy Auditor-General 
who shall be competitively recruited by the office of the Auditor-
General and appointed by the Audit Advisory Board. 

 
 (2) A person shall be qualified for appointment as the 

Senior Deputy Auditor-General if that person meets all the 
qualifications for appointment as outlined in section 5 of this Act. 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (153) 
 
CLAUSE 17 
 
 THAT, clause 17 of the Bill be amended in— 
(c) in  subclause (1) by deleting the expression “Article 234(5)” and substituting therefor the 

expression “Article 230”; 
 

(d) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “and approved by the Public Service Commission”; 
 

(e) in subclause (3) by inserting the words “ and shall comply with the values and principles 
of public service as contemplated in Article 232 of the Constitution” immediately after 
the words “marginalized groups”. 

 

CLAUSE 18 
 

THAT, clause 18 of the Bill be amended in— 
(a) subclause (2) by inserting the word “be” immediately after the words “ an officer of 

the office and”; 
 
(b) subclause (3) by deleting the words “thirty-six” and substituting therefor “twenty-

four”. 

CLAUSE 20  
 
THAT, clause 20 of the Bill be amended by— 

(a) deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 
 

“(2)  The Auditor-General shall submit and discuss the budget estimates before 
the relevant committee of the National Assembly together with the Cabinet 
Secretary responsible for finance and agree on the budgetary allocations for the 
coming year, not later than 30th November each year”; 

 
(b) inserting the following new subclauses immediately after subclause (2)— 

“(2A) The budget estimates agreed to under subsection (2) shall be included in 
the Budget Policy Statement without alterations. 
  
(2B) If changes are made to the agreed budget estimates, the Auditor-General 
shall inform the chairperson of the relevant committee of the National 
Assembly in writing not later than the 15th January in every year”; 

(c) inserting a new clause immediately after clause (3)— 
 

“(3A) Funds meant for the recurrent expenditure of the Auditor General under 
this section shall be disbursed to the office in equal quarterly installments.” 

 
CLAUSE 22 
 
THAT, clause 22 of the Bill be amended in subclause (3) by deleting the phrase “What will 
happen if this is abused?” appearing immediately after the words “information so obtained.” 
 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (154) 
 
CLAUSE 23 
 
THAT, clause 23 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1) by inserting the words “and the public service” immediately after the 
words “of the office of the Auditor-General”; 
 

(b) in subclause (7) by— 
 

(i)  deleting the expression “thirty-six (36)” and substituting therefor the expression 
“twenty-four ”; 

 
(ii)  inserting a new subclause immediately after subclause (7)— 

 

“(8) Outsourcing of any audit services under this section shall not absolve 
the Auditor-General of any responsibility concerning the exercise of his 
or her powers under this Act.”   

CLAUSE 24 
 

THAT, clause 24 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by inserting a new subclause 
immediately after subclause (1)— 

“(2) The engagement of service under subsection (1) shall be for purposes of ensuring 
effectiveness in the application of public funds.” 

 
CLAUSE 25 
 

THAT, clause 25 of the Bill be amended— 
(i) in subclause (1) by — 

(i)  inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (a)— 

“(aa) the Auditor-General”; 
(ii)  inserting the following proviso immediately after paragraph (g)— 

“Provided that the nominee under paragraph (c) shall not be a member of a 
professional body provided for under subsection (1) (b), (d) or (e)”; 

(j) in subclause (3) by deleting the words “appoint a chairperson from among the 
persons” and substituting therefor “ chair the Board established”. 

CLAUSE 27 
 

THAT, clause 27 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1)— 
(a) by deleting the word “advice” and substituting therefor the word “advise”; 

 

(b) by inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (a)— 
 

“(aa) develop, review  and advise on organizational development issues”; 
 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting the words “review and make recommendations on” and 
substitute  therefor “ consider and approve the”; 
 

(d) by inserting a new paragraph immediately after paragraph (c)— 



 
(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (155) 

 
“(ca) determine the remuneration and other terms of appointment of the staff 
of the Office of the Auditor General in consultation with the Salaries and 
Remuneration Commission”; 

 
(e) by deleting paragraph (d); 

 
(f) by deleting paragraph (f). 

CLAUSE 30 
 
THAT, clause 30 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “and information 
“immediately after the word “documents”. 
 
CLAUSE 31 
 

THAT, clause 31 of the Bill be amended by inserting a new subclause immediately after 
subclause (6)— 
 

“(6A) The Speaker of the National Assembly shall convene a special sitting of 
the committee of the whole House where the Auditor-General shall present his 
or her final report without debate or questions being put.” 

 

CLAUSE 37 
 

THAT, clause 37 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 
 

(b) inserting a new sub clause immediately after the renumbered subclause (1)— 
 

 “(2) The Auditor-General may seek professional assistance in conducting an 
environmental audit as provided for under subsection (1).” 

 

CLAUSE 38 
 

THAT, clause 38 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 
 

(b) inserting a new sub clause immediately after the renumbered subclause (1)— 
 

“(2) The Auditor-General may seek professional assistance in examining a 
public procurement and asset disposal process under subsection (1).”  

 

CLAUSE 40 
 

THAT, clause 40 of the Bill be amended — 
(a) in subclause (1) by deleting paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 
 

“(b) such information has been agreed upon between the Auditor-General and 
the respective national security organ or their representatives, not to be covered 
in the scope of audit”; 



 
(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (156) 

 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting paragraph (d); 
 

(c) in subclause (4) by deleting the words “ because the Attorney-General has issued a 
certificate under paragraph (1) (b) in relation to the information” and substitute 
therefor “for reasons cited under subsection (1)”; 

 

(d) by deleting subclause (6); 
 

(e) by deleting subclause (7). 

CLAUSE 41 
 
THAT clause 41 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) (c) by deleting the words “and 
approved by Parliament”. 
 
CLAUSE 42 
 
THAT, clause 42 of the Bill be amended by inserting a new subclause immediately after 
subclause (1)— 

“(1A) Procedures prescribing the appointment of external auditors under this section 
shall be as provided for in the regulations”. 

 
CLAUSE 48 
 
THAT, clause 48 of the Bill be amended — 

(a) in subclause (2) by deleting the word “it” appearing immediately after the words 
“county assembly”; 
 

(b) by deleting subclause (5). 

 
CLAUSE 50 
 
THAT, clause 50 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “publicization” and 
substituting therefor “publication”. 
 
CLAUSE 54 
 
THAT clause 54 of the bill be deleted and replaced with the following new clause— 
 

Observing the code 
of conduct 

54. The Auditor General, in discharging his or her functions 
and responsibilities shall strictly observe the code of 
conduct for all public officers as relates to the Office of the 
Auditor General, which shall be in line with those 
prescribed by the Constitution, this Act, Public Officers 
Ethics Act, 2003 and the relevant professional bodies. 

 
 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (157) 
 
CLAUSE 56 
 
THAT clause 56 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “any way in” immediately 
after the words “or corrupted in”. 
 
CLAUSE 57 
 
THAT, clause 57(2) of the Bill be amended by inserting the word “as” immediately after the 
words “for official purposes”. 
 
CLAUSE 58 
 
THAT, clause 58(1) of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “for consideration in” and 
substituting therefor “under consideration by” 
 
CLAUSE 60 
 

THAT, clause 60 of the Bill be amended— 
(a)  in subclause (1)— 

 

(i) by deleting paragraph (e); 
 

(ii) in paragraph (f) by inserting the words “ knowingly” immediately before the 
word “Discloses”; 

 

(iii) in paragraph (g) by deleting the words “ or decision”; 
 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “ liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding ten 
million shillings or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding five years, or to both” 
and substituting therefor  “ disciplined in line with the established code of ethics and 
liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding five million shillings or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding three years, or to both” 
 

CLAUSE 61 
 

THAT, clause 61 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) in— 
(a) paragraph (a) by inserting the words “ or a professional” immediately after the words 

“Auditor-General”; 
 

(b) paragraph (d) by inserting the words “ or a professional” immediately after the words 
“Auditor-General”. 

CLAUSE 62 
 
THAT, clause 62 of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “for committing” appearing 
immediately after the words “found guilty” and substituting therefor the word “of”. 
 

CLAUSE 67 
 

THAT, clause 67 of the Bill be deleted. 
 

 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (158) 
 
CLAUSE 68 
 

THAT, clause 68 of the Bill be amended by— 
 

(a) renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 
 

(b) inserting a new subclause immediately after the renumbered subclause (1)— 
 

“(2) The regulations made under this section shall be tabled before the National 
Assembly pursuant to the provisions of the Statutory instruments Act”. 

 
CLAUSE 72 
 
THAT, clause 72 of the Bill be deleted. 
 

 
3. Notice is given that the Member for Tongaren (Hon. Dr.  Eseli Simiyu), intends 

to move the following amendments to the Public Audit Bill, 2014 at the 
Committee Stage- 

 
CLAUSE 4 
THAT clause 4 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause 3 by deleting the words “as far as it is 
appropriate to do so” appearing immediately after the word “Republic”. 
 

CLAUSE 5 
THAT clause 5 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (1) by deleting paragraph (c). 
 
CLAUSE 11 
THAT clause 11 of the Bill be amended – 

(a) by deleting sub clause (2) and substituting therefor the following new sub clause – 

“(2) Where a vacancy occurs under subsection (1), the President shall within fourteen 
days nominate a suitable candidate and forward the name to the National Assembly”.  

(b) by deleting sub clauses (3), (4), (5), (6), (7), (11), (12) and (13); 
(c) by deleting the words “from amongst the candidates forwarded by the Public Service 

Commission under subsection (6)” appearing immediately after the word “nominee” in 
paragraph (b) of sub clause (9); 

(d) in sub clause (10)  by − 
(i) deleting the words “all or” appearing immediately after the word “rejects”; 
(ii) deleting the word “subsequent” appearing immediately after the word “any”; 
(iii) deleting the expression “subsections (1) to (7)” appearing immediately after the 

word “of” and substituting therefore the expression  “subsections (1) and (2)”. 

CLAUSE 12 
THAT clause 12 of the Bill be deleted. 
 
 
 
 
 



 

(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (159) 
 
 

CLAUSE 17 
THAT clause 17 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new sub clause 
immediately after sub clause (1) – 

“(1A) The remuneration of such staff should reflect the prevailing remuneration of 
such staff performing similar duties in the audit profession in other public and private 
institutions in Kenya”. 

 
CLAUSE 22 
THAT clause 22 of the Bill be amended in sub clause (3) by deleting the words “What will 
happen if this is abused?” appearing immediately after the words “information so obtained”. 
 
CLAUSE 27 
THAT clause 27 of the Bill is amended in sub clause (1) by − 

(a) deleting the words “and shall, in particular but without prejudice comprise of the 
foregoing” appearing immediately after the word “Act”; 

(b) deleting paragraphs (a), (b), (c), (d), (e), (f) and (g). 

CLAUSE 35 
THAT clause 35 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “may” appearing immediately 
after the word “Auditor-General” and substituting therefore the word “shall”. 
 
CLAUSE 36 
THAT clause 36 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “may” appearing immediately 
after the word “Auditor-General” and substituting therefore the word “shall”. 
 
CLAUSE 37 
THAT clause 37 of the Bill be deleted. 
 
CLAUSE 40 
THAT clause 40 of the Bill be amended – 

(a) in sub clause (1) by –  
(i) deleting the words “for any of the reasons set out in subsection (2); and” 

appearing immediately after the word “interest” in paragraph (a); 
(ii) deleting paragraph (b); 

(b) by deleting sub clause (2); 
(c) by deleting sub clause (3) and substituting therefor the following new sub clause – 

“(3) The Auditor-General shall be required, at a closed door session, to disclose 
to a committee of Parliament and to the President information that has been 
withheld under subsection (1)(a)”; 

(d) in sub clause (4) by – 
(i) deleting the words “because the Attorney-General has issued a certificate       

under paragraph (1)(b) in relation to the information” appearing immediately   
after the words “public report”; 

(ii) deleting paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the following new paragraph – 
“(b) the reason for that omission.” 



(No.024)       THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2015             (160) 
 

(e) in sub clause (5) by deleting the words “and such officers shall be at a grade equivalent 
to Deputy Director of Audit or above” appearing immediately after the word 
“confidentiality”; 

(f) by deleting sub clauses (6), (7) and (8). 

 
CLAUSE 72 
THAT clause 72 of the Bill be deleted. 

 
 

 
 
The House resolved on Wednesday, February 11, 2015 as follows:- 
 
 

III.THAT, notwithstanding the provisions of Standing Order 97(4), each speech in a debate on a 
Report of a Committee, including a Report of a Joint Committee of the Houses of 
Parliament,  a Sessional Paper or any other Report submited to the House, shall be limited as 
follows: - A maximum of sixty (60) minutes for the Mover in moving and thirty (30) minutes in  
replying, and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking, except the 
Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a 
maximum of  fifteen (15) minutes each; and that priority shall be accorded to the Leader of the 
Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, in that Order. 

 

IV.  THAT, notwithstanding the provisions of Standing Order 97(4), each speech in a debate on 
Bills sponsored by a Committee, the Leader of the Majority Party or the Leader of the 
Minority Party shall be limited as follows:- A maximum of fourty five (45) minutes for the 
Mover, in moving and fifteen minutes (15) in replying, a maximum of thirty (30) minutes for 
the Chairperson of the relevant Committee (if the Bill is not sponsored by the relevant 
Committee), and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking, except the 
Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a 
maximum of fifteen Minutes (15) each (if the Bill is not sponsored by either of them); and that 
priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the 
Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, in that Order. 

 
       
 

 
          

 
 

 
 

       ….….……Notice Paper



NOTICE PAPER 
 

Tentative business for 
 

Tuesday, March 24, 2015 
(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1) 

 
It is notified that the House Business Committee, at their last meeting, approved the following 
tentative business to appear in the Order Paper for Tuesday, March 24, 2015:- 
  

 
A. MOTION - THE SPECIAL REPORT ON THE RECAPITALIZATION &   

   BALANCE  SHEET RESTRUCTURING OF TELKOM KENYA   
   LIMITED  

   (The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee) 
 
     (If not concluded on Thursday, March 19, 2015) 

 
B. MOTION -  REPORT ON THE PRIVATIZATION OF THE PUBLIC    

   SECTOR OWNED/CONTROLLED SUGAR COMPANIES 
    (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance, Planning &   
    Trade )         

   
     (If not concluded on Thursday, March 19, 2015) 

  
C. MOTION -  REPORT OF THE FIFTH ORDINARY SESSION OF THE   

   PAN- AFRICAN PARLIAMENT & THE ANNUAL SPEAKERS’   
   CONFERENCE (2014) 

   (The Second Chairperson of Committees) 
 

  
     (If not concluded on Thursday, March 19, 2015) 

 
 


