

















The Finance Bill, 2021

541

(iv) the maintenance of a fixed place of
business solely for the purpose of
purchasing goods or merchandise, or
of collecting information, for the
enterprise;

(v) the maintenance of a fixed place of
business solely for the purpose of
carrying on, for the enterprise, any
other activity; and

(vi) the maintenance of a fixed place of
business solely for any combination of
activities mentioned in paragraphs (i)
to (v).

3. Section 3 of the Income Tax Act is amended—

(a) in subsection (2), by deleting paragraph (ca) and
substituting  therefor the following new
paragraph—

(ca) income accruing from a business carried
out over the internet or an electronic
network including through a digital
marketplace;

(b) in subsection (3), by deleting paragraph (ba) and
substituting  therefor the following new
paragraph—

(ba) “digital marketplace” means an online
platform which enables users to sell or
provide services, goods or other property
to other users.

4. Section 4A of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (4) by deleting the definition of the word
‘“control”.

5. Section 12E of the Income Tax Act is amended—

(a) in subsection (1)—

(i) by deleting the word “person” and
substituting therefor the expression “non-
resident person”;

Amendment of
section 3 of Cap.
470.

Amendment of
section 4A of Cap.
470.

Amendment of
section 12E of
Cap. 470.



542 The Finance Bill, 2021

(1) by deleting the proviso;

(b) by deleting subsection (2) and substituting therefor
the following new subsection—

(2) A person subject to digital service tax shall
submit a return and pay the tax due to the
Commissioner on or before the twentieth day of
the month following the end of the month in
which the digital service was offered.

(c) by inserting the following new subsection
immediately after subsection (2)—

(3) Despite subsection (1), digital service tax
shall not apply to income chargeable under section
9(2) or section 35.

6. Section 15 of the Income Tax Act is amended —

(a) in subsection (2), by deleting the words “and in
this subparagraph “control” has the meaning
assigned to it in paragraph 32 of the Second
Schedule” appearing in subparagraph (r)(iv);

(b) by deleting subsection (4) and substituting therefor
the following new subsection—

(4) Where the ascertainment of the total income
of a person results in a deficit for a year of
income, the amount of that deficit shall be an
allowable deduction in ascertaining the total
income of such person for that year and the
succeeding years of income.

7. Section 16 of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (2) by—

(a) deleting paragraph (j) and substituting therefor the
following new paragraph—

() gross interest paid or payable to related
persons and third parties in excess of thirty
per cent of earnings before interest, taxes,
depreciation and amortization of the
borrower in any financial year:

Provided that—

Amendment of
section 15 of Cap.
470.

Amendment of
section 16 of Cap.
470.



The Finance Bill, 2021

543

(i) any income which is exempt from tax
shall be excluded from the calculation
of earnings before interest, taxes,
depreciation and amortization; and

(ii)  this paragraph shall apply to—

(A)
(B)

©

interest on all loans;

payments that are economically
equivalent to interest; and

expenses incurred in connection
with raising the finance.

(b) inserting the following new paragraph immediately
after paragraph (j)—

Cap. 488.

(ja) an amount of deemed
interest where the person is
controlled by a non-resident
person alone or together
with not more than four
other persons and where the
company is not a bank or a
financial institution licensed
under the Banking Act.

8. The Income Tax Act is amended by inserting the
following new section immediately after section 18A—

Returns on
activities in
other
jurisdictions.

18B. (1) In this section—

“multinational enterprise
group” means a group that
includes two or more enterprises
which are resident in different
jurisdictions including an
enterprise that carries on business
through a permanent
establishment or through any
other  entity in another
jurisdiction; and

“ultimate  parent entity”
means an entity that—

Insertion of new
section in Cap.
470.



544 The Finance Bill, 2021

(a) is resident in Kenya for
tax purposes;

(b) is not controlled by
another entity; and

(c) owns or controls a
multinational enterprise
group.

(2) An ultimate parent entity
of a multinational enterprise
group shall submit to the
Commissioner a return
describing the group’s financial
activities in Kenya, where its
gross turnover exceeds the
prescribed threshold, and in all
other jurisdictions where the
group has taxable presence, not
later than twelve months after the
last day of the reporting financial
year of the group.

(3) The return submitted
under subsection (2) shall contain
the prescribed information on the
group’s aggregate information
including information relating to
the amount of revenue, profit or
loss before income tax, income
tax paid, income tax accrued,
stated  capital, accumulated
earnings, number of employees
and tangible assets other than
cash or cash equivalents with
regard to each jurisdiction in
which the group operates.

9. Section 31 of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (1) by inserting the words “or a contribution
made to the National Hospital Insurance Fund”
immediately after the expression “2007” appearing in
paragraph (v) of the proviso to the subsection.

Amendment of
section 31 of Cap.
470.



The Finance Bill, 2021

545

10. Section 39B of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (1) by inserting the words “or technical and
vocational education and training” immediately after the
word “university”.

11. Section 41 of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (5) by deleting the words “an individual or
individuals” appearing immediately after the words “held
by” and substituting therefor the words “a person or
persons”.

12. Paragraph 1 of Second Schedule to the Income
Tax Act is amended—

(a) in subparagraph (a), by deleting the words “on
reducing balance” wherever they occur and substituting
therefor the words “in equal instalments”;

(b) in subparagraph (b)—

(i) by deleting the words “on reducing balance”
wherever they occur and substituting therefor
the words “in equal instalments”;

(ii) by deleting the words “under a mining right”
appearing in subparagraph (xi);

(c) in subparagraph (c), by deleting the words “on
reducing balance” and substituting therefor the words “in
equal instalments”;

(d)in subparagraph (d), by deleting the words “on
reducing balance” and substituting therefor the words “in
equal instalments”;

(e) in the proviso—

(i) by deleting the words “through the national
grid” appearing immediately after the word
“electricity” appearing in subparagraph (f)
thereof;

(ii) by adding the following new subparagraph
immediately after subparagraph (f)—

(g) civil works include—
(i) roads and parking areas;

(ii) railway lines and related structures;

Amendment of
section 39B of
Cap. 470.

Amendment of
section 41 of Cap.
470.

Amendment of the
Second Schedule
to Cap. 470.



546 The Finance Bill, 2021

(iii)water, industrial effluent and sewerage works;

(iv)communications and electrical posts and
pylons and other electrical supply works; and

(v) security walls and fencing.

13. The Ninth Schedule to the Income Tax Act is
amended—

(a) in paragraph 4, by deleting subparagraph (3) and
substituting  therefor the following new
subparagraph—

(3) The rate of depreciation for machinery first
used to undertake operations under a prospecting
right shall be the rate specified in paragraph
1(b)(x) of the Second Schedule.

(b) in paragraph 9, by deleting subparagraph (3) and
substituting  therefor the following new
subparagraph—

(3) The rate of depreciation for machinery first
used to undertake exploration operations shall be
the rate specified in paragraph 1(b)(xi) of the
Second Schedule.

(c) in paragraph 15—

(i) by deleting the expression “5.625%” appearing
in item (a) of subparagraph (2) and substituting
therefor the expression “ten per cent”.

(i1) by deleting the expression “5.625%” appearing
in item (b) of subparagraph (2) and substituting
therefor the expression “ten per cent”.

(d) in paragraph 16, by deleting the words “twelve and
a half per cent” appearing in subparagraph (d) and
substituting therefor the expression “ten per cent”.

(e) by deleting paragraph 18 and substituting therefor
the following new paragraph—

:?lf:r‘;;ibi“‘y"f The provisions of section 16(2)(j)
: shall apply to a contractor or a
licensee.

Amendment of the
Ninth Schedule to
Cap. 470.



The Finance Bill, 2021

547

PART III—VALUE ADDED TAX

14. Section 2 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended in subsection (1) by deleting paragraph (c) of the
definition of the term “supply of imported services” and
substituting therefor the following new paragraph—

(c) in the case of a registered person, the person
would not have been entitled to a full amount
of input tax payable if the services had been
acquired by that person in a taxable supply.

15. Section 5 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended—

(a) in subsection (7), by inserting the words “over the
internet or an electronic network or” immediately
after the word “made”;

(b) by deleting subsection (9) and substituting therefor
the following new subsection—

(9) For the purposes of this section, “digital
marketplace” means an online platform which enables
users to sell or provide services, goods or other property to
other users.

16. Section 10 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended—

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the word
“registered”’;

(b) in subsection (2), by deleting the expression “a
registered person referred to in subsection (1)’ and
substituting therefor the expression “the person
referred to in subsection (1) is a registered person
and”;

(c) in subsection (3), by deleting the words “by any
person”.

17. Section 17 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended—

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the word “section
“appearing  immediately  after the words
“provisions of this” and substituting therefor the
word “Act”;

Amendment of
section 2 of No.
35 0f2013.

Amendment of
section 5 of No.
350 f2013.

Amendment of
section 10 of No.
350f2013.

Amendment of
section 17 of No.
35 0f2013.



548 The Finance Bill, 2021

(b) in subsection (4), by inserting the words “leasing
or hiring” immediately after the word
“acquisition”.

18. Section 19 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended in subsection (2) by deleting the word
“registered”.

19. Section 34 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended by deleting subsection (9).

20. Section 67 of the Value Added Tax Act, 2013 is
amended by deleting subsection (2).

21. The First Schedule to the Value Added Tax Act,
2013 is amended—

(a) in Part [—
(i) by deleting paragraph 33;
(i1) by deleting paragraphs 34;

(iii) by deleting the following tariff numbers and
corresponding descriptions in the table
appearing after paragraph 39—

Tariff Number Description

3001.90.10 Heparin and its salts

3001.90.90 Other human or animal substances
prepared for  therapeutic  or
prophylactic uses, not elsewhere
specified or included

3002.10.00 Antisera and other blood fractions and
modified immunological products,
whether or not obtained by means of
biotechnological processes

0402.99.10 Milk, specially prepared for infants

0402.91.10 Other not containing added sugar or
other sweetening matters specially
prepared for infants

0402.21.10 Other milk in powder, granules, or

other solid forms, of a fat content, by
weight, exceeding 1.5%

Amendment of
section 19 of No.
35 0f 2013.

Amendment of
section 34 of No.

~ 350f2013.

Amendment of
section 67 of No.
35 0f 2013.

Amendment of
First Schedule to
No. 35 of 2013.


















554

The Finance Bill, 2021

120.

121.

122.

123.

124.

125.

126.

diagnostic or laboratory reagents whether or not
on a backing, other than those of heading 30.02
or 30.06, certified reference materials upon
approval by the Cabinet Secretary responsible for
matters relating to health.

Electro-diagnostic apparatus, of tariff numbers
9018.11.00, 9018.12.00, 9018.13.00, 9018.14.00,
9018.19.00, 9018.20.00, 9018.90.00 upon
approval by the Cabinet Secretary responsible for
matters relating to health.

Other instruments and appliances, of tariff
number 9018.41.00, used in dental sciences,
dental drill engines, whether or not combined on
a single base with other dental equipment, upon
approval by the Cabinet Secretary responsible for
matters relating to health.

Other instruments and appliances, including
surgical blades, of tariff number 9018.49.00,
9018.50.00 9018.90.00 used in dental sciences
upon approval by the Cabinet Secretary
responsible for matters relating to health.

Ozone therapy, oxygen therapy, aerosol therapy,
artificial ~ respiration or other therapeutic
respiration apparatus upon approval by the
Cabinet Secretary responsible for matters relating
to health.

Other breathing appliances and gas masks,
excluding protective masks having neither
mechanical parts nor replaceable filters upon
approval by the Cabinet Secretary responsible for
matters relating to health.

Artificial teeth and dental fittings of tariff
numbers 9021.21.00, 9021.29.00 and artificial
parts of the body of tariff numbers 9021.31.00,
9021.39.00, 9021.50.00 and 9021.90.00 upon
approval by the Cabinet Secretary responsible for
matters relating to health.

Apparatus based on the use of x-rays, whether or
not for medical, surgical or dental of tariff
numbers 9022.12.00, 9022.13.00, 9022.14.00 and
























































































































594 The Finance Bill, 2021

(ii) no relief shall be granted in respect of a premium for an insurance
unless the person claiming the relief furnishes evidence as to the
nature and conditions of the insurance and such other particulars as
may be required by the Commissioner;

(iii) an education policy with a maturity period of at least ten years
shall qualify for relief; and

(iv) the provisions of this section shall apply only to life or education
policies whose term commences on or after 1st January, 2003;

(v) a health policy whose term commences on or after lst January,
2007shall qualify for relief;

(vi) where a policy is surrendered before its maturity, all the relief
granted to the policyholder shall be recovered from the surrender
value of the policy and remitted to the Commissioner by the
insurer.

(2) In this section «child”, means any child of the resident individual
and includes a step-child, an adopted child and an illegitimate child who
was under the age of eighteen years on the date the premium was paid.

Section 39B of Cap. 470 which it is proposed to amend—
Set-off tax rebate for apprenticeships

39B. (1) Any employer who engages at least ten university graduates
as apprentices for a period of six to twelve months during any year of
income shall be eligible for tax rebate in the year subsequent to the year of
such engagement.

(2) The Cabinet Secretary may by notice in the Gazette make
regulations for the better carrying out of the provisions of this section

Section 41 of Cap 470 which it is proposed to amend—
Special arrangements for relief from double taxation

41. (1) The Minister may from time to time by notice declare that
arrangements, specified in the notice and being arrangements that have
been made with the Government of any country outside of the Republic of
Kenya with a view to affording relief from double taxation in relation to
income tax and any taxes of a similar character imposed by the laws of
that country, shall, subject to subsection (5) but notwithstanding any other
provision to the contrary in this Act or in any other written law, have
effect in relation to income tax, and every such notice shall, subject to the
provisions of this section, have effect according to its tenor.



The Finance Bill, 2021 595

(2) Any such arrangements in the notice may include provisions for
relief from tax for periods before the commencement of this Act or before
the making of the arrangements.

(3) Any notice under this section may be at any time amended or
revoked by a subsequent notice and an amending or revoking notice may
contain such transitional provisions or termination date as appear to the
Minister to be necessary or expedient.

(4) The Minister shall cause a copy of every notice made under
subsection (1) of this section and of every subsequent notice made under
subsection (3) of this section to be laid, without delay, before the

Parliament.

(5) Subject to subsection (6), where an arrangement made under this
section provides that income derived from Kenya is exempt or excluded
from tax, or the application of the arrangement results in a reduction in the
rate of Kenyan tax, the benefit of that exemption, exclusion, or reduction
shall not be available to a person who, for the purposes of the
arrangement, is a resident of the other contracting state if fifty per cent or
more of the underlying ownership of that person is held by an individual
or individuals who are not residents of that other contracting state for the
purposes of the agreement.

(6) Subsection (5) shall not apply if the resident of the other
contracting state is a company listed in a stock exchange in that other
contracting state

(7) In this section, the terms "person" and "underlying ownership"
have the meaning assigned to them in the Ninth Schedule.

Section 2 of No.35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend—

“supply of imported services” means a supply of services that
satisfies the following conditions—

(a) the supply is made by a person who is not a registered person to
any person;

(b) the supply would have been a taxable supply if it had been made
in Kenya; and

(c) the registered person would not have been entitled to a credit for
the full amount of input tax payable if the services had been
acquired by the person in a taxable supply;

Section 5 of No. 35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend—
Charge to tax






The Finance Bill, 2021 597

35. (1) If a supply of imported taxable services is made to any person,
the registered person shall be deemed to have made a taxable supply to
himself.

(2) If a registered person referred to in subsection (1) is entitled to—

(a) a credit for part of the amount of input tax payable, the value of
the taxable supply under subsection (1) shall be reduced by an
amount equal to the supply that is entitled for the input tax credit;
or

(b) a full input tax credit payable on the imported taxable services
under subsection (1), the value of the taxable services shall be
reduced to zero.

(3) The output tax in respect of a deemed taxable supply under
subsection (1) shall be payable by any person at the time of the supply.

(4) For the purposes of this section, if a registered person carries on a
business, both in and outside Kenya, the part of the business carried on
outside Kenya shall be treated as if it were carried out by a person separate
from the registered person.

Section 17 of No. 35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend—
Credit for input tax against output tax

17. (1) Subject to the provisions of this section and the regulations,
input tax on a taxable supply to, or importation made by, a registered
person may, at the end of the tax period in which the supply or importation
occurred, be deducted by the registered person, subject to the exceptions
provided under this section, from the tax payable by the person on
supplies by him in that tax period, but only to the extent that the supply or
importation was acquired to make taxable supplies.

(2) If, at the time when a deduction for input tax would otherwise be
allowable under subsection (1), the person does not hold the
documentation referred to in subsection (3), the deduction for input tax
shall not be allowed until the first tax period in which the person holds
such documentation.

Provided that the input tax shall be allowable for a deduction within
six months after the end of the tax period in which the supply or
importation occurred.

(3) The documentation for the purposes of subsection (2) shall be—

(a) an original tax invoice issued for the supply or a certified copy;



598 The Finance Bill, 2021

(b) a customs entry duly certified by the proper officer and a receipt
for the payment of tax;

(c) a customs receipt and a certificate signed by the proper officer
stating the amount of tax paid, in the case of goods purchased
from a customs auction;

(d) a credit note in the case of input tax deducted under section 16(2);
or

(e) a debit note in the case of input tax deducted under section 16(5).

(4) A registered person shall not deduct input tax under this Act if
the tax relates to the acquisition of—

(a) passenger cars or mini buses, and the repair and maintenance
thereof including spare parts, unless the passenger cars or mini
buses are acquired by the registered person exclusively for the
purpose of making a taxable supply of that automobile in the
ordinary course of a continuous and regular business of selling or
dealing in or hiring of passenger cars or mini buses; or

(b) entertainment, restaurant and accommodation services unless—

(i) the services are provided in the ordinary course of the
business carried on by the person to provide the services and
the services are not supplied to an associate or employee; or

(i) the services are provided while the recipient is away from
home for the purposes of the business of the recipient or the
recipient’s employer:

Provided that no tax shall be charged on the supply where no input
tax deduction was allowed on that supply under this subsection.

(5) Where the amount of input tax that may be deducted by a
registered person under subsection (1) in respect of a tax period exceeds
the amount of output tax due for the period, the amount of the excess
shall be carried forward as input tax-deductible in the next tax period:

Provided that any such excess shall be paid to the registered person
by the Commissioner where —

(a) such excess arises from making zero rated supplies; or

(b) such excess arises from tax withheld by appointed tax
withholding agents; and

(c) such excess arising out of tax withheld by appointed tax
withholding agents may be applied against any tax payable



The Finance Bill, 2021 599

under this Act or any other written law, or is due for refund
pursuant to section 47(4) of the Tax Procedures Act, 2015; and

(d) the registered person lodges the claim for the refund of the
excess tax within twenty-four months from the date the tax
becomes due and payable.

Provided further that, notwithstanding section 17(5)(d), a registered
person who, within a period of thirty-six months prior to the
commencement of sectionl7(5)(b) and (c), has a credit arising from
withholding tax, may make an application for a refund of the excess tax
within twelve months from the commencement date.

(6) Subject to this Act, if a taxable supply to, or a taxable import by,
a registered person during a tax period relates partly to making taxable
supplies and partly for another use, the input tax deductible by the person
for acquisitions made during the tax period shall be determined as
follows—

(a) full deduction of all the input tax attributable to taxable supplies;

(b) no deduction of any input tax which is directly attributable to
other use; and

(c) deduction of input tax attributable to both taxable supplies and
other uses calculated according to the following formula: A x
Where —A is the total amount of input tax payable by the person
during the tax period on acquisitions that relate partly to making
taxable supplies and partly for another use is the value of all
taxable supplies made by the registered person during the period;
and C is the value of all supplies made by the registered person
during the period in Kenya.

(7) If the fraction of the formula in subsection (6) for a tax period—

(a) is more than 0.90, the registered person shall be allowed an input
tax credit for all of the input tax comprising component A of the
formula; or

(b) is less than 0.10, the registered person shall not be allowed any
input tax credit for the input tax comprising component A of the
formula.

Section 19 of No.35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend—
When tax is due

19. (1) Tax shall be due and payable at the time of supply.



600 The Finance Bill, 2021

(2) Notwithstanding the provision of subsection (1), a registered
person may defer payment of tax due to a date not later than the twentieth
day of the month succeeding that in which the tax became due.

Section 34 of No. 35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend-
Application for registration
34. (1) A person who in the course of a business—

(a) has made taxable supplies or expects to make taxable supplies, the
value of which is five million shillings or more in any period of
twelvemonths; or

(b) is about to commence making taxable supplies the value of which
is reasonably expected to exceed five million shillings in any
period of twelve months, shall be liable for registration under this
Act and shall, within thirty days of becoming so liable, apply to the
Commissioner for registration in the prescribed form.

(2) In determining whether a person exceeds the registration
threshold for a period, the value of the following taxable supplies shall be
excluded—

(a) a taxable supply of a capital asset of the person; and

(b) a taxable supply made solely as a consequence of the person
selling the whole or a part of the person’s business or
permanently ceasing to carry on the person’s business.

(3) Notwithstanding subsection (1), a person who makes or intends
to make taxable supplies may apply, in the prescribed form, to the
Commissioner for voluntary registration.

(4) The Commissioner shall register a person who has applied for
voluntary registration under subsection (3) if satisfied that—

(a) the person is making, or shall make taxable supplies;

(b) the person has a fixed place from which the person’s business is
conducted;

(c) if the person has commenced carrying on a business, the person—
(i) has kept proper records of its business; and

(ii) has complied with its obligations under other revenue laws;
and

(d) there are reasonable grounds to believe that the person shall keep
proper records and file regular and reliable tax returns.



The Finance Bill, 2021 601

(5) The Commissioner shall issue a registered person with a tax
registration certificate in the prescribed form.

(6) If the Commissioner is satisfied that a person eligible to apply for
registration has not done so within the time limit specified in subsection
(1), the Commissioner shall register the person.

(7) The registration of a person under subsection (1) or (6) shall take
effect from the beginning of the first tax period after the person is required
to apply for registration, or such later period as may be specified in the
person’s tax registration certificate.

(8) The registration of a person under subsection (4) shall take effect
from the date specified in the person’s tax registration certificate.

(9) The Cabinet Secretary may, in regulations, provide for the
registration of a group of companies as one registered person for the
purposes of the Act.

Section 67 of No. 35 of 2013 which it is proposed to amend—

Regulations

35. (1) The Cabinet Secretary may make regulations for the better
carrying of the provisions of this Act, and without prejudice to the
generality of the foregoing, the regulations may—

(a) prescribe conditions and procedures for the registration of
registered persons;

(b) provide for the submission of returns and the place at which
returns are to be submitted and tax is to be paid,;

(c) prescribe the form of notices, returns or other forms required for
the purposes of this Act;

(d) prescribe offence and penalties thereto;

(e) prescribe rules for particular types of supplies and in relation to
input tax credits; or

(f) prescribe any other thing required to be prescribed for the
purposes of any provision of this Act.

(2) Regulations made under this section shall be tabled before the
National Assembly for approval before they take effect.



602 The Finance Bill, 2021

Section 14 of No. 23 of 2015 which it is proposed to amend-
Relief for raw materials

14. (1) Where excise duty has been paid in respect of excisable goods
imported into, or manufactured in Kenya by a licensed manufacturer and
which have been used as raw materials in the manufacture of other
excisable goods (hereinafter referred to as "finished goods"), the excise
duty paid on the raw materials shall be offset against the excise duty
payable on the finished goods.

Section 35A of Cap. 4854 which it is proposed to amend—
Establishment of the Capital Markets Tribunal

35A. (17) Upon any appeal to the Tribunal under this section the
status quo of any matter or activity, which is the subject of the appeal,
shall be maintained until the appeal is determined.

Section 2 of Cap 487 which it is proposed to amend—

2. “broker” means an intermediary concerned with the placing of
insurance business with an insurer or reinsurer for or in expectation of
payment by way of brokerage, commission, for or on behalf of an insurer,
policy-holder or proposer for insurance or reinsurance and includes a
health management organisation; but does not include a person who
canvasses and secures reinsurance business from or to an insurer or broker
in Kenya so long as that person does not undertake direct insurance
business and does not have a place of business, or a resident
representative, in Kenya

Section 20 of Cap. 487 which it is proposed to amend—
Placing of risks with insurers and reinsurers not registered under this
Act

20. (3) Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) shall be deemed to have been
complied with in respect of any reinsurance treaty or contract in force on
the appointed date or the date of the renewal of the treaty or contract,
whichever is earlier, if the treatyor contract is certified by the Kenya
Reinsurance Corporation Limited as having been approved by that
company.

Section 5A of No. 2 of 1995 which it is proposed to amend—

Rewards
5A. (2) The reward payable under subsection (1) shall be—



The Finance Bill, 2021 603

(@) in the case of information leading to the identification of
unassessed duties or taxes, one per centum of the duties or taxes so
identified or one hundred thousand shillings, whichever is the less;

(b) in the case of information leading to the recovery of unassessed
duties or taxes, five per centum of the taxes or duties so recovered
or two million shillings, whichever is the less; and (c) in the case
of information not specified in paragraph (a) and (b) leading to the
enforcement of the tax laws, five hundred thousand shillings.

Section 2 of No. 3 of 1997 which it is proposed to amend—

“retirement benefits scheme” means any scheme or arrangement
(other than a contract for life assurance) whether established by a written
law for the time being in force or by any other instrument, under which
persons are entitled to benefits in the form of payments, determined by
age, length of service, amount of earnings or otherwise and payable
primarily upon retirement, or upon death, termination of service, or upon
the occurrence of such other event as may be specified in such written law
or other instrument;

“trust corporation” means a company incorporated under the
Companies Act (Cap. 486) having a subscribed capital of not less than ten
million shillings and which is for the time being empowered (by or under
any written law, its charter, memorandum of association, deed of
settlement or other instrument constituting it or defining its powers) to
undertake trusts:

Provided that such company does not, by any prospectus, circular,
advertisements, or other documents issued by it or on its behalf, state or
hold out that any liability attaches to the Public Trustee or to the
Consolidated Fund in respect of any act or omission of the company when
acting as an executor or administrator;

Section 22 of No. 3 of 1997 which it is proposed to amend—

Retirement  benefits schemes, managers, custodians and
administrators to be registered

22. (2) No person shall act as a manager, custodian or administrator
unless such person is registered under this Act and holds a valid certificate
of registration issued pursuant to the provisions of this Act.

(3) The Authority shall, in consultation with the Minister, by notice
in the Gazette and by public advertisement in at least one daily newspaper
of wide circulation, publish a list of all registered managers, custodians
and administrators at least once in every calendar year.



604 The Finance Bill, 2021

(4) A person who—
(a) establishes a retirement benefits scheme; or

(b) acts as a manager or custodian, contrary to the provisions of this
section commits an offence and shall be liable on conviction, to a
fine not exceeding five hundred thousand shillings, or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding two years, or to both.

Section 23 of No. 3 of 1997 which it is proposed to amend—
Registration

23. (1) A person proposing to establish a retirement benefits scheme
or to act as a manager, a custodian or an administrator shall apply to the
Authority for, and obtain, a certificate of registration before establishing
the scheme or commencing the performance of any of the functions of a
manager, a custodian or an administrator.

(2) An application under subsection (1) shall be—
(a) addressed to the Chief Executive Officer;

(b) in the prescribed form; and (c) accompanied by the prescribed
fae

(3) In considering an application under this section, the Authority
may request the applicant to supply such additional information as it
considers necessary in determining the application.

(4) The Authority may, subject to the provisions of this Act and on
payment of the prescribed fee, register the applicant and issue to the
applicant a certificate of registration in the prescribed form, authorising
the applicant to establish a retirement benefits scheme, or to act as a
manager, a custodian or an administrator as the case may be.

(5) A certificate issued under this section shall be subject to such
conditions as the Authority may, in consultation with Minister, impose.

Section 26 of No. 3 of 1997 which it is proposed to amend—
Requirements with regard to trustees

26. (2) No person shall be a trustee of any scheme fund if such
person—

(a) has been sentenced to imprisonment by a court of competent
jurisdiction for a period of six months of more;
(b) is adjudged bankrupt;

Section 27 of No. 3 of 1997 which it is proposed to amend—















