
Twelfth Parliament       Fifth Session 
          Afternoon Sitting 
           
              
   (No. 102)          (1280) 
 

 

REPUBLIC OF KENYA 
 

TWELFTH PARLIAMENT – (FIFTH SESSION) 
 

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
 

ORDERS OF THE DAY 
 

WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021 AT 2.30 P.M. 

 

ORDER OF BUSINESS 
PRAYERS 
 

1. Administration of Oath 
2. Communication from the Chair 
3. Messages 
4. Petitions 
5. Papers 
6. Notices of Motion  
7. Questions and Statements 

 

8*. THE CHILDREN BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 38 OF   
  2021) 

 (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 
   First Reading 
 

9*. THE COUNTY GOVERNMENTS GRANTS BILL (SENATE BILL NO.  
  35 OF 2021) 

 (The Chairperson, Budget and Appropriations Committee) 
 
   First Reading 
 

10*. THE BASIC EDUCATION (AMENDMENT) BILL (SENATE BILL 
NO. 4 OF 2021) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Education and Research) 
 
   First Reading 
 

11*. THE MENTAL HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL (SENATE BILL   
   NO. 28 OF 2020) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Health) 
    
   First Reading  

    ........./12* 
 
 
 



 

(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1281) 
 
 

12*. THE COUNTY LICENCING (UNIFORM PROCEDURES) BILL   
   (SENATE BILL NO. 32 OF 2020) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry and      
Cooperatives) 

 

   First Reading  
 

13*.THE SALARIES AND REMUNERATION COMMISSION 
(AMENDMENT) BILL (SENATE BILL NO. 31 OF 2020) 

 (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 
 

   First Reading  
 

14*. MOTION – FURTHER CHANGES TO COMMITTEE MEMBERSHIP 
                     (The Chairperson, Committee on Selection)  
 

THAT, further to the resolutions of the House of Tuesday, 5th December, 
2017, Wednesday, 15th July, 2020 and 11th February 2021 appointing Members to 
various Committees and pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 173, this 
House further approves the appointment of the following Members to the 
respective Committees specified hereunder–  

 

(i) The Hon. John Munene Wambugu, MP to move from the Departmental 

Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs to the Departmental Committee 

on Administration and National Security; 

(ii) The Hon. Daniel Kipkogei Rono, MP to be appointed to the 

Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs; 

(iii) The Hon. Gathoni Wamuchomba, MP to move from the Departmental 

Committee on Transport, Public Works and Housing to the 

Departmental Committee on Agriculture and Livestock; 

(iv) The Hon. Moses Malulu Injendi, MP to move from the Committee on 

Regional Integration to the Departmental Committee on Transport, 

Public Works and Housing;  

(v) The Hon. Benjamin Gathiru Mwangi, MP to move from the Select 

Committee on National Cohesion and Equal Opportunity to the 

Committee on Regional Integration;  

(vi) The Hon. George Ndung’u Koimburi, MP to be appointed to the Select 

Committee on National Cohesion and Equal Opportunity; 

(vii) The Hon. John Njuguna Wanjiku, MP to be appointed to the Select 

Committee on Implementation; and 

(viii) The Hon. Mohammed Lokiru Ali, MP to move from the Departmental 

Committee on Energy to the Departmental Committee on Education 

and Research; and 

(ix) The Hon. Pavel Oimeke, MP to be appointed to the Departmental 

Committee on Energy. 

    ........./15* 



 
(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1282) 
 

15*. MOTION –    SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 1 OF 2021 ON THE NATIONAL 
                       WATER POLICY  
                       (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Environment                    
 and Natural Resources)  

 
THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee 

on Environment and Natural Resources on Sessional Paper No. 1 of 2021 on 
the National Water Policy, laid on the Table of the House on Wednesday, August 4, 
2021, and further approves Sessional Paper No. 01 of 2021.  

 
16*. MOTION -    RATIFICATION OF THE BILATERAL AIR SERVICES  

AGREEMENTS BETWEEN THE REPUBLIC OF KENYA 
AND THE REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA; AND 
BETWEEN THE REPUBLIC OF KENYA AND THE 
REPUBLIC OF BOTSWANA  
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Transport, Public 
Works and Housing)  

 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee 
on Transport, Public Works and Housing on the Ratification of the Bilateral Air 
Services Agreements between the Republic of Kenya and the Republic of South 
Africa; and Between the Republic of Kenya and the Republic of Botswana, laid 
on the Table of the House on Tuesday, September 28, 2021, and pursuant to the 
provisions of section 8(4) of the Treaty Making and Ratification Act, 2012, 
approves the Ratification of: -  

 

(i) the Bilateral Air Services Agreement between the Republic of Kenya and the 
Republic of South Africa; and  
 

(ii) the Bilateral Air Services Agreement Between the Republic of Kenya and the 
Republic of Botswana.   

 

17*. MOTION –   RATIFICATION OF THE BILATERAL AIR SERVICES  
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE GOVERNMENT OF 
THE REPUBLIC OF KENYA AND THE GOVERNMENT 
OF THE RUSSIAN FEDERATION  
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Transport, Public 
Works and Housing)  
 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee 
on Transport, Public Works and Housing on the Ratification of the Bilateral Air 
Services Agreement between the Government of the Republic of Kenya and the 
Government of the Russian Federation, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday, 
September 30, 2021, and pursuant to the provisions of section 8(4) of the Treaty 
Making and Ratification Act, 2012, approves the Ratification of the Bilateral Air 
Services Agreement between the Government of the Republic of Kenya and the Government of 
the Russian Federation.  

........./18* 
 



 
(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1283) 
 
18*. MOTION –    CONSIDERATION OF THE PETROLEUM  

DEVELOPMENT LEVY (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2021 
(The Chairperson, Committee on Delegated Legislation)  

 

 THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Committee on Delegated 
Legislation on its consideration of the Petroleum Development Levy 
(Amendment) Order, 2021, laid on the Table of the House on Wednesday, September 29, 
2021, and pursuant to the provisions of section 18 of the Statutory Instruments 
Act, 2013 and Standing Order 210 (4)(b), annuls in entirety the Petroleum 
Development Levy (Amendment) Order, 2021, published as Legal Notice No. 77 
of 2021. 

 

 
19*. THE KENYA NATIONAL COMMISSION ON HUMAN RIGHTS  
  (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 1 OF 2020) 
  (The Chairperson, Constitutional Implementation Oversight Committee) 
 
      Second Reading  

 
20*. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 

 

The Waqf Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 73 of 2019) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 
 

21*. THE MEDIATION BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 17 OF  
  2020) 
  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 
      Second Reading  
 
 

22*. THE COMMUNITY GROUPS REGISTRATION BILL (NATIONAL  
  ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 20 OF 2020) 
  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 
      Second Reading  
 
 

 

 
 

      * Denotes Orders of the Day 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

    ........./Notices* 
 

 
 



(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1284) 
 
 

N O T I C E S 

 
 

I. THE WAQF BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL 

NO. 73 OF 2019) 

 
 

1) Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on 
Justice and Legal Affairs intends to move the following amendments to 
the Waqf Bill, 2019 at the Committee Stage— 

 

CLAUSE 2 

THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new definition in the proper 

alphabetical sequence ─ 

 

“Hajj” means the pilgrimage to Makka made at least once in a lifetime by 

an able bodied Muslim who can afford it;” 

 

 

CLAUSE 6 

THAT, clause 6 of the Bill be amended – 

(a) in the opening paragraph ─ 

(i) by deleting the word “Attorney-General” and substituting therefor the 

words “Public Trustee”; 

(ii) by deleting the word “President” and substituting therefor the word 

“Attorney-General”; 

(b) by deleting paragraph (b); 

(c) by deleting paragraph (c); 

(d) in paragraph (e)- 

(i) by deleting the word “four” and substituting therefor the word “six”; 

 (ii) by inserting the following new sub-paragraphs immediately after sub-

paragraph (iv)- 

               “(v) finance and investment; 

               (vi) architecture; 

               (vii) administration”. 

 



 
(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1285) 
 

CLAUSE 7 

THAT, clause 7 of the Bill be amended ─ 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the word “President” and substituting therefor 

the word “Attorney-General”; 

(b) in subclause (2) – 

(i)  by deleting the word “President” and substituting therefor the 

word “Attorney-General” appearing in the opening paragraph; 

(ii) by inserting the words “knowledgeable in sharia law” immediately 

after the word “leaders” appearing in the opening paragraph; 

(iii) by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after 

paragraph (a)- 

“(ab) a person having a conflict of interest whether directly in person 

or indirectly as a family member or a beneficiary or lessee of a waqf 

shall not be appointed as a member of the selection panel; 

(ac) no state officer or public officer shall be appointed as a member 

of the selection panel”. 

(c) in subclause (3) (d) by deleting the word “President” and substituting 

therefor the word “Attorney-General”; 

(d) in subclause (4) by deleting the word “President” and substituting 

therefor the word “Attorney-General”;  

(e) by inserting the following new sub-clause immediately after sub-clause 

(5)- 

  “(5A) The expenses and liabilities of the selection panel shall be borne 

by the Government”; 

(f) in sub-clause (6) by deleting the word “three” wherever it appears and 

substituting therefor the word “five”; and 

(g) in subclause (7) (c) by deleting the word “President” and substituting 

therefor the word “Attorney-General”. 
 

CLAUSE 8 

THAT, clause 8 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new paragraphs 

immediately after paragraph (g) – 

“(ga) develop and facilitate adequate continuous training programmes to enhance 

the standard and effectiveness of trustees;  

(gb) formulate, implement and oversee programmes to raise awareness on Waqf 

matters; 

 (gc) co-ordinate, license, supervise and regulate services relating to Hajj in      

Kenya; 

 (gd) represent Kenya in matters relating to Hajj”; 
 



(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1286) 

 

CLAUSE 9 

THAT, clause 9 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new sub-clause 

immediately after sub-clause (4)- 

“(4A) The members of the Commission shall serve on a part-time basis”. 

 

CLAUSE 11 

THAT, Clause 11 of the Bill be amended- 

(a) in sub-clause (2)(d) by inserting the words “or a reputable private institution” 

at the end of the paragraph; 

(b) by inserting the following new sub-clause immediately after sub-clause (3)- 

   “(4) The Director-General shall be the Secretary to the Commission”. 

 

CLAUSE 15 

THAT, Clause 15 of the Bill be amended ─ 

(a) in subclause (1) (b) (ii) by inserting the words “or a beneficiary or any 

person who has an interest in the waqf” immediately after the word 

“trustees”; 

(b) in subclause (3) by inserting the words “a beneficiary or any person who 

has an interest in the waqf” immediately after the words “trustees of a 

waqf”. 

 

CLAUSE 16 

THAT, Clause 16 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2) by deleting the words 

“twenty thousand” and substituting therefor the words “two million”. 
 

CLAUSE 17 

THAT, Clause 17 of the Bill be amended ─ 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the word “sell”; 

(b) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (1) 

– 

“(1A) A person who intends to sell immovable Waqf property shall make 

an application to the Environment and Land Court and the Environment 

and Land Court may allow the application or issue any other order it 

deems appropriate”. 

(c) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “subsection (1)” and substituting 

therefor the words “this section”. 
 

CLAUSE 21 

THAT, Clause 21 of the Bill be deleted. 

 



(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1287) 
 

CLAUSE 23 

THAT, Clause 23 of the Bill be amended by deleting the proviso. 

 

NEW CLAUSES 

THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new Clauses immediately 

after Clause 27 - 

Right to access 
information. 

27A. (1) A beneficiary of a waqf shall, at all reasonable times, be 
entitled to information about the waqf including the inspection of 
accounts and shall upon payment of the prescribed fees be supplied 
with copies of any deeds or documents thereof. 
(2) The information under subsection (1) does not include 
correspondence and any other confidential information. 

  
  
Disputes 
resolution. 

27B. Any matter or dispute relating to a waqf shall in the first 
instance be referred to a Kadhi’s court. 

  
  

 

Exemption 
from taxation 
or penalties 

27C. Despite the provisions of any other written law, the income of 
the Commission shall not be subjected to income tax or any other 
tax or penalty. 

 

 

2) Notice is given that the Member for Suba North (Hon. Millie Odhiambo 
Mabona, MP) intends to move the following amendments to the Waqf 
Bill, 2019, at the Committee Stage— 

 
CLAUSE 2 

THAT, clause 2 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by inserting the word “appointed under section 12A” immediately after the 
words “waqf property” appearing in the definition of the term “trustee”; 

(b)  by inserting the word “permanent” immediately after the words “endowment 
or” appearing in the definition of the term “waqf”; 

(c) by inserting the following new definitions in their proper alphabetical 
sequence— 

“testamentary waqf” means a waqf that takes effect after the death of the 
waqf; 

“Zakat” means payment made annually under Islamic law on certain kinds 
of property and used for charitable and religious purposes. 

 



(No. 102)  WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021     (1288) 

CLAUSE 4 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 4 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

Validity of a 

waqf. 
4. (1) A waqf shall be valid where — 

(a) the waqf has attained eighteen years; 

(b) the waqf is of sound mind; 

(c) it is made in accordance with Islamic law;  

(d) it is made for religious purposes, save as provided 

under paragraph (e); 

(e) it is made for the benefit of the Muslim community 

and if secular in character, it is reserved for the 

benefit of the poor; 

(f) it is permanent in nature; 

(g) there is no condition attached to the donation of the 

waqf by the waqf; and 

(h) the waqf believes in the principles of the Islamic 

faith. 

(2) A person shall only make a waqf in relation to property 

that the person owns. 

(3) A widow shall not constitute any waqf of the property 

which she holds in lieu of her unpaid dower. 

(4) Except a testamentary waqf, a person may dedicate his or 

her entire property as a waqf. 

(5)A person shall not dedicate more than one-third of his or 

her property to a waqf in case of a testamentary waqf. 

(6) A waqf shall not be used for purposes prohibited by 

Islamic law, repairs or maintenance of the waqf’s secular 

property, providing for the rich or for objects which are 

uncertain. 

 

CLAUSE 7 

THAT, clause 7 of the Bill be amended— 

 



(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021   (1289) 

(a) by deleting subclause (1) and substitute therefor the following new 

subclause— 

(1) The President shall, within three months of the commencement of 
this Act or within fourteen days after the occurrence of a vacancy 
in the Commission, appoint a selection panel for the purpose of 
nominating suitable candidates for appointment as a member of 
the Commission under section 6 (a), (b), (c), (d) and (e). 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “of either gender” and substituting 

therefor the words “persons, three of whom shall be”; 

(c) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (2) — 

(2A) The appointing authority shall afford equal opportunity to men 
and women, youth, persons with disabilities and minorities and 
marginalized groups and ensure regional balance in appointing the 
members of the Selection Panel. 

(d) in subclause (4) by deleting the words “from Muslims” and substituting 

therefor the words “from the public”; 

(e) in subclause (7)(b) by deleting the words “without the permission of the 

chairperson” and substituting therefor the words “without notifying the 

chairperson”. 

 

CLAUSE 9 

THAT, clause 9 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (4). 

 

CLAUSE 11 

THAT, clause 11(2) of the Bill be amended by deleting paragraph (a). 

 

CLAUSE 12 

THAT, clause 12 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new subclause 

immediately after subclause (2) — 

(3) The Commission shall, in appointing the staff under subsection (1), 
afford equal opportunity to men and women, youth, persons with 
disabilities and minorities and marginalized groups and ensure regional 
balance. 

 

 

 



 

(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021   (1290) 
 

NEW CLAUSES 

THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new clauses in Part III 

immediately after clause 12 — 

Appointment of a 

trustee. 
12A. (1) Every waqf shall have a trustee appointed by— 

(a) an executor of the waqf where the waqf did not 

appoint a trustee; or 

(b) the Court where there is a dispute on trusteeship. 

(2) A person, male or female of any religion shall be appointed 

as a trustee if he or she is an adult of sound mind and has 

capacity to perform the functions of the waqf as prescribed by 

the waqf.  

(3) Despite subsection (2), a person who is female shall not be 

qualified to be appointed as a trustee if the waqf requires the 

trustee to undertake religious duties. 

(4) The court shall in appointing a trustee under subsection (1) 

ensure that it gives regard to the instructions of the waqf, 

public interest and preference of the family members of waqf. 

 

Powers of a trustee. 12B. (1) A trustee shall be in charge of the property of the waqf 

and shall have the power to utilize the property as the trustee 

considers it fit for the purpose of the waqf.  

(2) A trustee shall also take reasonable steps and act in good 

faith to ensure that the intended beneficiaries benefit from the 

waqf including using instituting proceedings, where necessary, 

to protect the interest of a waqf.   

(3) Except where the waqf authorizes the trustee to dispose of 

property, the trustee shall have no right to sell any property 

which is a subject of a waqf.  

 

 

 



 
(No. 102) WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021 (1291) 

(4) A trustee shall borrow money in relation to a waqf or sell a 

waqf where there are justifiable reasons to do so and only 

where the court has issued an order to borrow or otherwise 

dispose off the property under a waqf.  

(5) Except with the leave of court, a trustee shall lease any 

property under a waqf for agricultural purposes for not more 

than three years and for non-agricultural purposes for not 

more than one year. 

(6) A trustee shall have a right to be remunerated as provided 

by a waqf and where a trustee considers the remuneration 

inadequate, the trustee may apply to court for redress.   

 
Removal of a trustee. 12C. (1) A trustee shall be removed from office only by a court 

on ground of — 

(a) misappropriation of a waqf property; 
(b) allowing the waqf property to fall into disrepair when 

the trustee has funds to maintain the property;  
(c) knowingly or intentionally causing damage or loss to 

waqf property; or 
(d) breach of trust in relation to the waqf property. 

(2) Despite subsection (1), a trustee may be removed from 

office by the waqf, if the right to remove the trustee is reserved 

in the waqf deed. 

CLAUSE 13 

THAT, clause 13 be amended in sub-clause (5) by deleting the words “one 

hundred” and substitute therefor the words “five hundred”. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

…....../Notices* 

 
 



 
(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1292) 

 

LIMITATION OF DEBATE 
 
 

 

The House resolved on Wednesday, February 10, 2021 as follows- 
 

 
Limitation of Debate on Motions 
 

I. THAT, each speech in a debate on any Motion, including a Special motion 
shall be limited in the following manner:- A maximum of three hours with not 
more than twenty (20) minutes for the Mover and ten (10) minutes for each other 
Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the 
Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15) minutes each, 
and THAT ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover shall be 
called upon to reply; and THAT priority in speaking shall be accorded to the 
Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson 
of the relevant Departmental Committee, in THAT order. 
 
Limitation of Debate on Bills sponsored by Parties or Committees 
 

 

II. THAT, each speech in a debate on Bills sponsored by a Committee, the 
Leader of the Majority Party or the Leader of the Minority Party shall be 
limited as follows:- A maximum of forty five (45) minutes for the Mover, in 
moving and fifteen minutes (15) in replying, a maximum of thirty (30) minutes for 
the Chairperson of the relevant Committee (if the Bill is not sponsored by the 
relevant Committee), and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member 
speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority 
Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen Minutes (15) each (if the Bill 
is not sponsored by either of them); and THAT priority in speaking shall be 
accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and 
the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, in THAT order. 

 
 
 

Limitation of Debate on Sessional Papers  
 

III. THAT, each speech in a debate on any Sessional Paper shall be limited as 
follows:- A maximum of two and a half hours, with not more than twenty (20) 
minutes for the Mover in moving and five (5) minutes for any other Member 
speaking, including the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the 
Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Committee (if the Sessional 
Paper is not moved by the Chairperson of the relevant Committee), and that ten 
(10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover shall be called upon to reply; 
and THAT priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority 
Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, in THAT order.  

 

 

 



 

(No. 102)      WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 13, 2021  (1293) 
 

 

Limitation of Debate on Committee Reports 

IV. THAT, each speech in a debate on Committee Reports (except for Reports of 
Audit Committees), including a Report of a Joint Committee of the Houses of 
Parliament or any other Report submitted to the House for which limitation of 
time has not been specified,  shall be limited as follows:- A maximum of two and 
a half hours, with not more than twenty (20) minutes for the Mover in moving and 
five (5) minutes for any other Member speaking, including the Leader of the 
Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the 
relevant Committee (if the Committee Report is not moved by the Chairperson of 
the relevant Committee), and that ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time, 
the Mover shall be called upon to reply; and further THAT priority in speaking 
shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the 
Minority Party, in THAT order. 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

…....../Notice Paper* 

 

 

 

 

 



 

NOTICE PAPER  
 

Tentative business for  

Thursday, October 14, 2021 

(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1)) 
 

 

It is notified that the House Business Committee has approved the following tentative 
business to appear in the Order Paper for Thursday, October 14, 2021- 

 

A. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

(i) The Central Bank of Kenya (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 
10 of 2021) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National 
Planning) 

 

(ii) The Trustees (Perpetual Succession) (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly 
Bill No. 23 of 2021) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National 
Planning) 

 
B. MOTION -   REPORT ON A PUBLIC PETITION BY RESIDENTS  

OF WAJIR AND GARISSA COUNTIES REGARDING LACK 
OF ACCESS TO CITIZEN REGISTRATION SERVICES  
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Administration and 
National Security)  

 
C. THE RADIOGRAPHERS BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 47 
     OF 2019)  
     (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Health)  

 

Second Reading 
 

D. MOTION -     ESTABLISHMENT OF A PARLIAMENTARY HEALTH  
   SERVICES UNIT  

         (The Chairperson, Committee on Members’ Services and Facilities) 
  

E. MOTION -      STUDY VISIT TO THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF  
 ALBERTA, CANADA  

(The Chairperson, Committee on Members’ Services and 
Facilities)        

    

      

F. MOTION -     THIRD REPORT ON IMPLEMENTATION STATUS OF  
INQUIRIES, PETITIONS AND RESOLUTIONS OF THE 
HOUSE  

  (The Chairperson, Committee on Implementation) 
 

 
 



 
  

G. THE NATIONAL COHESION AND PEACE BUILDING BILL  
     (SENATE BILL NO. 35 OF 2018)  
     (The Chairperson, Committee on National Cohesion and Equal Opportunity)  

 

 Second Reading 
 
 

H. MOTION -     ROLL-OUT OF COVID-19 ECONOMIC STIMULUS  
     PROGRAMME (Party-Sponsored Motion)  
    (The Hon. Abdullswamad Nassir, M.P.) 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
…....../Appendix* 
 

 

 



   A P P E N D I X 

NOTICE OF PETITIONS, QUESTIONS & 

STATEMENTS 

____________________ 
 

ORDER NO.7 -  QUESTIONS 
 

It is notified that, pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 42A (5), the 
following Members will ask questions for reply before the specified Committees- 

  

QUE NO ORDINARY QUESTIONS 

369/2021 The Member for Maragua (Hon. Mary Wamaua, MP) to ask 
the Cabinet Secretary for Transport, Infrastructure, Housing, 
Urban Development and Public Works: -  
(i) Could the Cabinet Secretary explain why the National 

Transport and Safety Authority charges Kshs.750 for 
issuance of interim driving licenses? 
 

(ii) Could the Cabinet Secretary also explain why the Authority 
has not been issuing the interim driving licenses despite 
collecting the said fee? 
 

(iii) What is the rationale for compelling applicants to pay and 
obtain the interim driving licenses and require them to also 
obtain the smart driving licenses? 
 

(iv) When will the Authority harmonize the process of 
application and issuance of interim driving licenses with that 
of issuance of the new smart driving license? 
 

 (To be replied before the Departmental Committee on Transport, Public Works 
and Housing) 

413/2021 

 

The Member for Laikipia North (Hon. Sarah Korere, MP) to 
ask the Cabinet Secretary for Agriculture, Livestock and 
Fisheries: - 

(i) What is the total size in acreage of the Agricultural 
Development Corporation (ADC) Mutara ranch in Laikipia 
County? 

(ii) Could the Cabinet Secretary state whether the Government 
has been utilizing the ranch and if so, list the major activities 
which take place therein? 

(iii) Could the Cabinet Secretary provide details of all individuals 
and companies to whom the Corporation has leased this farm 
to, size of acreage and the period of lease by each entity? 

 



(iv) Are there plans by the Government to utilize ADC Mutara 
ranch to assist the local pastoral community in improving their 
breeds and in range management practices? 

(To be replied before the Departmental Committee on Agriculture and 
Livestock) 

414/2021 

 

The Member for Kiambu County (Hon. Gathoni 
Wamuchomba, MP) to ask the Cabinet Secretary for 
Devolution: - 

(i) What is the total amount of relief food that has been allocated 
to the vulnerable population including persons with 
disabilities in Kiambu County from May 2020 to date? 

(ii) Could the Cabinet Secretary explain the criteria used by the 
Ministry to select the beneficiaries of the relief food 
programme? 

(iii) What measures has the Ministry put in place to cushion the 
vulnerable population including persons with disabilities in 
Kiambu County from the effects of the COVID-19 
Pandemic, famine and drought being experienced in most 
parts of the Country?  

(To be replied before the Departmental Committee on Administration and 
National Security) 

415/2021 

 

The Member for Endebess (Hon. (Dr.) Robert Pukose, MP) to 
ask the Cabinet Secretary for Devolution: - 

(i) Could the Cabinet Secretary clarify whether 300 bags of rice, 
which were part of relief food dispatched vide letter Ref No: 
MDP/SDSP/9/11Vol.1 (37), dated 11th May 2020 addressed to 
the Deputy County Commissioner, Endebess and copied to the 
area Member of Parliament for Endebess Constituency, were 
delivered and distributed to the intended beneficiaries? 

(ii) Could the Cabinet Secretary provide a list of all beneficiaries 
of the said relief food? 

(iii) Could the Cabinet Secretary provide a breakdown of all the 
relief food that was distributed in Trans Nzoia County in 2020 
indicating its estimated cost, details of all beneficiaries in the 
County indicating their sub-locations, locations and sub-
counties?   

(To be replied before the Departmental Committee on Administration and 
National Security) 

 

 

 


